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Primary care is the patient’s first point of entry into the 
health care system, offering health care closest to where 
individuals live and work. Primary health care (PHC) 
encompasses primary care, disease prevention, health 
promotion, population health, and community development 
within a holistic framework, with the aim of providing 
essential community-focused health care.1,2 Providing care 
within this framework results in a high level of complexity. 
Many challenges arise when delivering personalized, high-
quality care to a diverse and complex PHC population. In 
response to this complexity, transdisciplinary collaboration 
of different health professionals within clinical practice and 
in research is the solution.

Challenges of Primary Health Care and Research

PHC is a multidimensional concept derived from the social 
model of health. PHC should address the main health 
problem of the communities and reflect the socioeconomic, 
sociocultural, and political characteristics of the country it 
is in.3 Using this definition, providing care to one individual 
means not only looking at the disease of the patient, but at 
all elements of their life and environment. 

Thus, the main challenge of PHC is meeting the unique 
needs of the diverse and complex clientele it has to serve. 
Take for example the complex issue of the optimal clinical 
management of an elderly patient with multiple chronic 
diseases living in poverty. The intertwined issues of the 
patient’s life must be taken into account: his ability for 
self-management, his sociocultural environment, and 
his financial challenges. Take another patient: a recently 
immigrated healthy man with a university degree and 
employment in his native country before he moved, but 
since his arrival has been unemployed and develops 
symptoms of depression. It is likely that these patients’ 
sociocultural environments have a profound impact on 
their health and wellbeing, and all of this has to be taken 

into account. These two patients have quite distinct stories, 
but both need to receive the personalized, high-quality 
care that will address the underlying causes of their health 
challenges. 

In these two examples, what could be defined as ‘effective’ 
or ‘high-quality’ care? For the first patient, it might be to 
aim for a better quality of life in the context of his multiple 
chronic diseases. For the second, it might be to assist 
with his integration into his new environment, in order to 
address his depressive symptoms. Indeed, much research 
still needs to be done to better define what ‘good’ PHC is, 
and how to provide patient-centred care in this context of 
complexity.4,5

Transdisciplinarity and TUTOR-PHC

Historically, a single health professional, usually the PHC 
physician, was tasked with managing this kind of complexity. 
This is changing. The research questions focussed on PHC 
are also changing. Providing high-quality, patient-centred 
care for patients requires the effective collaboration of 
researchers and health professionals alike. This is where 
transdisciplinarity comes into play. Transdisciplinarity, 
defined as an approach that integrates the natural, social 
and health sciences and in so doing, transcends each of 
their traditional boundaries is an ideal approach when used 
appropriately.6

One example of successful transdisciplinary work in research 
is the TUTOR-PHC (Transdisciplinary Understanding and 
Training on Research – Primary Health Care) program, 
based at Western University.7 This fellowship has two main 
goals: first, to build a critical mass of skilled, independent 
researchers and second, to increase the transdisciplinary 
focus in PHC research.6 This annual program selects 
trainees from diverse fields, including sociology, 
occupational therapy, nursing, health education, clinical � 
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psychology, social work, policy-making, epidemiology, and 
family medicine. Since its creation in 2003, this program 
has trained more than one hundred fellows through an 
innovative curriculum and mentorship. 

One successful outcome of the TUTOR-PHC program 
is the Patient-Centred Innovations for Persons with 
Multimorbidity (PACE in MM).8,9 Recently funded by the 
Canadian Institutes of Health Research, this exemplary 
transdisciplinary collaboration in PHC has the mandate 
to improve the delivery of PHC for people with multiple 
chronic diseases, or multimorbidity.8 The PACE in MM 
team is co-led by a past TUTOR-PHC fellow and consists of 
twenty-one members, many of which are previous fellows 
or mentors of the TUTOR-PHC program. Not only will this 
team transform the way in which patients are managed in 
PHC, this work will be guided by the principles of patient-
centred medicine. These are two key elements of the future 
of PHC. 

Conclusion

The field of PHC is beautifully complex and is the cornerstone 
of our health care system; this is the reason each of us is 
drawn to it. PHC researchers and providers must challenge 
themselves to learn and work within a transdisciplinary 
environment, to go beyond their own disciplines and 
crumbling silos. Due to the increasing complexity of the 
PHC patient population or clientele, there is truly much 
at stake. This transdisciplinary collaboration is indeed the 
future of a high-quality and effective PHC system. ¾
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